
Building for Generations 

J.M Wilkerson Construction Co., Inc. was 
selected as the General Contractor for the       
new luxury condominiums Juniper & 5th in 
Atlanta, GA.  
 
J5 is located on a 1.8-acre site, on Juniper 
Street in Midtown. J5 is the first new luxury 
condominium of its kind in over a decade. 
Within the building, there will be a total of 
150, one and two bedroom condominiums. 
It will also feature 2 levels of partially 
underground parking, with 2 levels having 
direct access to the street, wood framed 
structure on a concrete podium, tiered 
rooftop terraces, courtyards and a pool.  
 
The amenities will include two landscaped 
courtyards, one with a pool and adjacent 
club room and fitness center, conferences 
rooms as well as a rooftop club room with a 
deck overlooking the skyline. 
 

Client 
Juniper & 5th Ventures, LP 
5950 Live Oak Parkway, Suite 320, 
Norcross, GA 30093 
Eric Xue 
404.731.8732 
 

Architect/Engineer 
Smith Dalia Architects, LLC 
621 North Avenue, NE, Suite C-140, 
Atlanta, GA 30308 
Greg Cross 
678.365.4155 
 

Start Date 
August 2018 
 

Completion Date 
March 2020 
 

Contract Amount 
$46,448,365 

Juniper & 5th  
Atlanta, Georgia 
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